Carol A. Schmidt

From: AAuxier@nmfire.org

Sent: Tuesday, January 25, 2011 6:56 AM

To: Carol A. Schmidt

Cc: Mark Radtke

Subject: Fw: NMFR - 101520 - Mod #19 for Approval
Attachments: NMFR Mod #19.pdf

Hi Carol,

As stated in my first email this is the second of two emails from Jill Kordus, Miron Construction regarding change orders
for the new Station #36 attached. Could you please put change orders NMFR Mod #19 on the agenda for the Public
Works Committee. Again, there will be a total of two emails that | am sending to you with a total of three change orders.
Could you please let me know if everything looks OK.

Thank you!

Al Auxier

Fire Chief

Neenah-Menasha Fire Rescue
aauxier@nmfire.or
(920)886-6203, office
(920)209-9509, cell

—— Forwarded by Al E Auxier/Fire/Neenah on 01/25/2011 06:47 AM —-

From: Jill. Kordus@Miron-Construction.com

To: sborsecnik@griesarchitectural.com

Cc: aauxier@nmfire.org, DSchultz@nmfire.org
Date: 01/24/2011 10:36 AM

Subject: NMFR - 101520 - Mod #19 for Approval
Steve,

Please see attached Mod #19 for review and approval.

Thank you,
Jill

Jill Kordus

Project Coordinator

Miron Construction Co., Inc
1471 McMahon Drive
Neenah, W1 54956

Phone: (920)-969-7008
Fax: (920)-969-7399
jill.kordus@miron-construction.com

Experience the Miron Difference at www.miron-construction.com
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JOB #:101520

MOD #: 0019 -00
DATED: 1/24/11
Building Excellence” CHANGE ORDER REQU EST
TO: Mr Steve Borsecnik FAX: 920-722-6605
Gries Architectural Group PHONE: 920-722-2445

500 N Commercial St
Neenah WI 54956

RE: Neenah Menasha Fire
Rescue Station 36
— . .108 Province Terrace —— - . . . . . —
Menasha WI 54952

DESCRIPTION OF MODIFICATION:

Provide custom cabinet and tops installed at 2 walls in Room 102.

REQUESTED BY: Owner DATE :
SUBCONTRACTOR AMOUNT
Discher Arch Millwork Inc $2,342.00
Miron Construction Co., Inc
Labor: 21 Hrs @ $70 _ $1,470.00
Materials, blocking, fasteners: $80.00
Subtotal $1,550.00
Subtotal $3,892.00
TOTAL AMOUNT QOF THIS MODIFICATION: $3,892.00
CHANGE ORDER AMOUNT REQUESTED: $3,892.00

Please find back up materials enclosed regarding this modification.

Contractor is (not) to proceed with the work as noted above. The contract
with the Owner is adjusted as follows:

Approved Cost Schedule Impact

Miron Representative VHI(/ ﬂm Date 1/24/11

Paul A. Riederer

Owner Representative Date

THIS PRICE IS VALID FOR 15 DAYS FROM THE DATE SHOWN

— Copy+File/jak——
Jobsite
Dan Schultz
Al Auxier

Corporate Office
P.O. Box 509 Neenah, Wi 54957-0509
MIRON CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 1471 McMahon Drive Neenah, Wi 54956

Buil ding Excellence Phone: 920/969-7000

Fax: 920/969-7399

www.miron-construction.com
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No. 6311 p. 4

DISCHEH AR@HUTE"CF’Uﬂ. M".LWQHK, INC.

2555 BADGER AVE, « F.0. Box 2943 « USHKDSH, WI 54903
Miron Construction ‘ o
1471 MecMahon Drive - '
Neenah—Wi*S#’Q‘S?

Attensjon; Pay] Riederer

Project: Neenap Menasha Fire Rescue Station

The pricing for Room 102 jg as follows;

1) L. shaped Counter

W/ 3mm edge, (S) 16
shelf w/ Standards

base cabnets W/ drawers’ (1) 8" wal
and brackets |,

 $2,060.00 ( no tax included)



