Carol A. Schmidt

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Good Morning Carol,

AAuxier@nmfire.org

Tuesday, January 25, 2011 6:52 AM

Carol A. Schmidt

Mark Radtke

Fw: NMFR - 101520 - Mods for Approval #18.01 and #20
NMFR Mod #18-01.pdf; NMFR Mod #20.pdf

You haven't heard from me in awhile so | figured it's about time for me to start bothering you again. Below you will find a
email from Jill Kordus, Miron Construction that has two change orders for the new Station #36 attached. Could you please
put change orders NMFR Mod #18-01 and NMFR Mod #20 on the agenda for the Public Works Committee. There will be
a total of two emails that | am sending to you with a total of three change orders. Could you please let me know if

everything looks OK.

Thank you!

Al Auxier
Fire Chief

Neenah-Menasha Fire Rescue

aauxier@nmfire.org
(920)886-6203, office
(920)209-9509, cell

—- Forwarded by Al E Auxier/Fire/Neenah on 01/25/2011 06:35 AM -—

From: Jill.Kordus@Miron-Construction.com

To: shorsecnik@griesarchitectural.com

Cce: aauxier@nmfire.org, DSchultz@nmfire.org

Date: 01/24/2011 03:30 PM

Subject: NMFR - 101520 - Mods for Approval #18.01 and #20
Steve,

Please see attached Mod #18-01 and #20 for review and approval.

Thank you,
Jill

Jill Kordus
Project Coordinator

Miron Construction Co., Inc

1471 McMahon Drive
Neenah, WI| 54956

Phone: (920)-969-7008

Fax: (920)-969-7399

jill. kordus@miron-construction.com




Carol A. Schmidt

From: AAuxier@nmfire.org

Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 7:17 AM

To: Carol A. Schmidt

Cc: Mark Radtke

Subject: Fw: NMFR - 101520 - Mod #18-02 for Approval
Attachments: NMFR Mod #18-02.pdf

Good Morning Carol,

| spent some time reviewing the data drops for our video conference system with the Neenah IS Department and the
electrician and we were able to reduce the number of lines the electrician was going to install. Could you please replace
Change Order Request MOD #: 0018-01 with the new Change Order Request MOD #: 0018-02 attached at the bottom of
this email for todays agenda meeting. Let me know if there is a problem with doing this and if you have any questions or
concerns let me know.

Thank you!

Al Auxier

Fire Chief

Neenah-Menasha Fire Rescue
aauxier@nmfire.or
(920)886-6203, office
(920)209-9509, cell

--—-- Forwarded by Al E Auxier/Fire/Neenah on 02/01/2011 07:09 AM —-

From: Jill. Kordus@Miron-Construction.com

To: sborsecnik@griesarchitectural.com

Cc: aauxier@nmfire.org, DSchultz@nmfire.org
Date: 01/31/2011 04:25 PM

Subject: NMFR - 101520 - Mod #18-02 for Approval
Steve,

Please see attached Mod #18-02 for review and approval.

Thank you,
Jill

Jill Kordus

Project Coordinator

Miron Construction Co., Inc
1471 McMahon Drive
Neenah, W| 54956

Phone: (920)-969-7008
Fax: (920)-969-7399

jill.kordus@miron-construction.com



JOB #:101520

MOD #: 0018 -02
DATED: 1/31/11
Building Excellence” CHANGE ORDER REQUEST
TOx Mr Steve Borsecnik FAX: 920-722-6605
Gries Architectural Group PHONE: 920-722-2445

500 N Commercial S8t
Neenah WI 54956

RE: Neenah Menasha Fire
Rescue Station 36
1108 Province Terrace
Menasha WI 54952

DESCRIPTION OF MODIFICATION:

Provide additional data jacks for video conferencing for training.
Run wiring for radio antenna.

REQUESTED BY: Owner DATE :
SUBCONTRACTOR AMOUNT
P & J Kampo Electric, Inc. $515.00
Subtotal $515.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF THIS MODIFICATION: $515.00
CHANGE ORDER AMOUNT REQUESTED: ==:===;;z;fgg

Please find back up materials enclosed regarding this modification.

Contractor is (not) to proceed with the work as noted above. The contract
with the Owner is adjusted as follows:

Approved Cost Schedule Impact

Miron Representative pﬁaﬂﬁ% Date 1/31:/10 =

Paul A. Riederer

Owner Representative Date

THIS PRICE IS VALID FOR 15 DAYS FROM THE DATE SHOWN

Copy: File/jak
Jobsite
Dan Schultz
Al Auxier

Corporate Office
e . N P.O. Box 509 Neenah, WI 54957-0509
MIPRON CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. 1471 McMahon Drive Neenah, Wi 54956

A

Buildi ng Excellence Phone: 920/969-7000

Fax: 920/869-7399

www.miron-construction.com



ITEMIZED PROPOSAL — CHANGE ORDER

Date: 1-18-11

Between the Owner:  Miron Construction Co— NMFR 36

And the Contractor: P & J Kampo Electric Inc.

50 Pheasant Ct. Appleton, WI 54915

(920) 730-8556
Project Name / Job #:

Listed below is an itemized description for the above mentioned Proposal Request.

QTY | DESCRIBE WORK, MATERIALS OR LABOR UNIT PRICE/RATE | AMOUNT
9" | Additional data jacks $105.00 $945-99— FL0)
‘] Run wiring for radio antenna $95.00 $95.00
TOTAL -$1:040.00- ...
Y

Signature indicates agreement herewith, including any adjustment in the Contract Total and

Contract Time.

Buyer

Contractor

Dated

Dated



