
From: Kara Homan
To: Kristi Heim
Subject: FW: Bridge tower lock
Date: Tuesday, July 31, 2012 8:01:03 PM

Kristi--

Please include the email correspondence below for the landmarks commission agenda item regarding
the Museum Lock.

Game plan for tomorrow is to get landmarks finalized...and then worry about finishing everything else
up on thursday.

--Kara

From: Kara Homan
Sent: Tuesday, July 24, 2012 1:35 PM
To: Adam Alix
Subject: RE: Bridge tower lock

Got it; I will relay the message to the Commission.
 
--kara
 
Kara Homan, AICP, Principal Planner
Community Development Department
City of Menasha | 140 Main St | Menasha, WI 54952
 920.967.3652 |  920.967.5272
 khoman@ci.menasha.wi.us |  www.cityofmenasha-wi.gov
http://www.linkedin.com/in/karahoman       
 

From: Adam Alix 
Sent: Tuesday, July 24, 2012 1:32 PM
To: Kara Homan
Subject: RE: Bridge tower lock
 
Yes we could buy the lock and power supply from others however seeing we have several already in 
some of our park facilities we will keep with the same move for maintenance purposes.  I believe I also 
shared with the cost estimate the price the library recently paid to have an electric strike installed.
 
So I'm confident the estimated cost i provided is going to be the best for the city.
 
Kara Homan <khoman@ci.menasha.wi.us> wrote:
 
Is there only one company to purchase the lock from…or a second one that we could still install it
ourselves?
 
--Kara
 
Kara Homan, AICP, Principal Planner
Community Development Department
City of Menasha | 140 Main St | Menasha, WI 54952
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From: Adam Alix 
Sent: Tuesday, July 24, 2012 12:57 PM
To: Kara Homan
Subject: Re: Bridge tower lock
 
I thought the estimated cost I provided was with it being installed by our city staff so no labor was 
included so I don't think we'll get it done for less if I go looking for price quotes.
 
We'll have to look at means of remote operation and accompanying cost to do so.
 
Kara Homan <khoman@ci.menasha.wi.us> wrote:
 
Hi Adam—
 
Did greg contact you about the request from the Landmarks commission regarding the lock at the
Bridgetower museum?  He’s out for the next few weeks so I’m trying to keep things afloat until he
returns 
 
The Commission has requested a few more price quotes on the automatic locking system, as well
as information as to whether the lock can be controlled remotely by the bridge tender.
 
We wouldn’t need this until the first week in august.
 
Kara Homan, AICP, Principal Planner
Community Development Department
City of Menasha | 140 Main St | Menasha, WI 54952
 920.967.3652 |  920.967.5272
 khoman@ci.menasha.wi.us |  www.cityofmenasha-wi.gov
http://www.linkedin.com/in/karahoman       
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